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Dari: Japen Sarage <japen.sarage@pbi.uad.ac.id>
Date: Kam, 1 Des 2022 15.49

Subject: Fwd: paper sumission

To: <kasiyarnoyogya@gmail.com>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Japen Sarage <japen.sarage@pbi.uad.ac.id>
Date: Thu, Dec 1, 2022 at 3:48 PM

Subject: Fwd: paper sumission

To: <kasiyarnoyogya@gmail.com>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: EDITOR IJSELL <editor_ijsell@arcjournals.org>
Date: Tue, Feb 3, 2015 at 12:52 AM

Subject: Re: paper sumission

To: Japen Sarage <japen.sarage@gmail.com>

Dear Sir,
Thank you very much for your publication charges.

Regards

On Mon, Feb 2, 2015 at 8:32 PM, Japen Sarage <japen.sarage@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear IJSELL Editors

In accomplishment of the requirement for IUSELL publication, | have transferred a sum of $ 100 to Mr. Sathees Surthani for the publication of
my article ID: 01V31205. | also enclose the copy of signed copy right form. since the photographs are not yet ready, | will send them later
together with short CV forms. Thank you very much for the publication and | am looking forward to hearing your answer.

Sincerely yours.

Japen Sarage

2015-01-30 23:41 GMT+07:00 EDITOR IJSELL <editor_ijsell@arcjournals.org>:

Dear JapenSarage, Dr. Kasiyarno
Hearty Congratulations !!!

Paper ID : 01V31205

We are happy to inform you that the paper entitled “Arabic Personal Pronouns as Word, Clitic, and
Affix” that you had sent for publication in “International Journal on Studies in English Language and
Literature (IJSELL), ISSN 2347-3126 (Print) & ISSN 2347-3134 (Online)” is provisionally accepted after its
review. We are therefore requested to credit the publication charges amounting USD 100 + transaction
charges for online publication only or USD 150 + transaction charges for both online and printing in mode of
operation mentioned here under.

You are requested to remit the amount to
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=735fee8644 &view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1751007584780705211&simpl=msg-f%3A1751007... 1/4
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Option-1 (Wire Transfer)

Account Holder Name Academicians Research Center

Bank Name HDFC Bank

Branch Name YOUSUFGUDA, Hyderabad

Account Number 50200000214512

Swift Code HDFCINBBHYD

IFSC Code/Routing No HDFC0002604

Bank Address Ground. Floor,H.No:8-3-231/W/62/G1, Womens CO-
OP. HSG.Society, Sree Krishna Nagar Cross Road,
Yousufguda, Hyderabad, Andhra Pradesh,INDIA
Pin-500045.

Option-2 (Western Union/Money Gram)

Payment is also accepted through Telegraphic means like Western Union, Money Gram or by using International Postal
Money Orders. Before doing all such payments send us an email to get the name and address to whom you need to send
(It’s fast and easy).

Option 3 (Using Paypal)

Authors can deposit publication charges by credit card/debit card/visa card/master card using PayPal.

Kindly visit the following link to pay the publication processing charges using Paypal.

http://www.arcjournals.org/processing-charges.php

Kindly send the scanned copy of remittance pay in slip to our email on or before 07-02-2015. Write the Paper ID and
any one of the Author’s Name at the top of the Payment Slip/ Bank Counter Slip.

Include the brief information of the authors (not exceeding 10 lines) with photos at the end of the article.

IJSELL expects your timely response and cooperation.

We are attaching review report, copyright form and paper acceptance letter for your kind perusal. Kindly return
the copyright form duly signed as early as possible.

Thanking you

With best Regards
K.Venkatesh

Editorial Assistant
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On Tue, Jan 27, 2015 at 2:59 PM, EDITOR IJSELL <editor_ijsell@arcjournals.org> wrote:

Dear Japen Sarage,

We are in receipt of your paper for which we highly appreciate you for your cooperation and we expect the
same cooperation in future also. We will send your paper duly reviewed with the comments whatsoever.

Your Paper ID: 01V31205

Best Regards
K.Venkatesh
Editorial Assistant

ARC Journals

On Mon, Jan 26, 2015 at 4:25 PM, Japen Sarage <japen.sarage@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Editors

| am very grateful for the publication of my past article in IJSELL. Here with, | once again send another article entitted ARABIC
PERSONAL PRONOUNS AS A WORD, CLITIC, AND AN AFFIX . | hope you can consider and later can publish it.

Thank you.
Japen Sarage
2014-11-17 16:51 GMT+07:00 Japen Sarage <japen.sarage@gmail.com>:
Dear Editors.
Thank you for your response. | am looking forward to getting the news. Thank you.
Sincerely yours
Japen

On Nov 17, 2014 1:18 PM, "EDITOR IJSELL" <editor_ijsell@arcjournals.org> wrote:
Dear Author,

Your paper is under review. We will send the review report soon.

Regards

On Sat, Nov 15, 2014 at 11:01 PM, Japen Sarage <japen.sarage@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Editors.
Would you please inform us your comment on my article ref. 01V211120 so that | can revise it. Thank you.
Japen Sarage M.A.

On Nov 9, 2014 3:40 PM, "Japen Sarage" <japen.sarage@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Editors

Thank you very much
Japen Sarage, M.A.

2014-11-08 13:45 GMT+07:00 EDITOR IJSELL <editor_ijsell@arcjournals.org>:

Dear Author,

We are in receipt of your paper for which we highly appreciate you for your cooperation
and we expect the same cooperation in future also. We will send your paper duly reviewed with
the comments whatsoever.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=735fee8644 &view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1751007584780705211&simpl=msg-f%3A1751007...  3/4


http://www.arcjournals.org/
mailto:editor_ijsell@arcjournals.org
mailto:japen.sarage@gmail.com
mailto:japen.sarage@gmail.com
mailto:editor_ijsell@arcjournals.org
mailto:japen.sarage@gmail.com
mailto:japen.sarage@gmail.com
mailto:editor_ijsell@arcjournals.org

12/8/22, 11:32 AM Gmail - Fwd: paper sumission
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Best Regards
K.Venkatesh
Editorial Assistant

ARC Journals

On Sat, Nov 8, 2014 at 10:41 AM, Japen Sarage <japen.sarage@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Editors
International Journal on Studies in English Linguistics and Literature.

Soon after | got informed about your journal, | am interested to write in your journal. Here with, | send a paper to
consider for the next publication. | hope the topic is relevant and it is worth publishing.

Your sincerely
Japen Sarage, M.A.
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