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2 messages

TEM Journal <temjournal@gmail.com> Wed, Jun 1, 2022 at 3:19 AM
Bcc: sulisworo@gmail.com

Dear Authors,

Your paper has been published in Tem Journal, Vol.11, No.2

Online version can be viewed and downloaded from www.temjournal.com

In the following days we will upload the Journal in the bases and the catalogues on Internet.

Please check whether everything is technically in order with your paper.

Let us know as soon as possible (Wednesday 1. June 2022.), so we can in timely manner correct the
mistake.

After that we will not make any corrections.

Best Regards,

Editorial Board office,
office@temjournal.com
temjournal@gmail.com
www.temjournal.com

sulisworo dwi <sulisworo@gmail.com> Wed, Jun 1, 2022 at 11:01 AM
To: TEM Journal <temjournal@gmail.com>

Yes, everything is correct.
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Re: Poslato sa sajta
10 messages

TEM Journal <temjournal@gmail.com> Wed, Mar 9, 2022 at 4:.04 AM
To: sulisworo@gmail.com

Dear Dwi Sulisworo,

We have received your manuscript and forwarded it to reviewers.
Thank you for sending.

If your paper pass review processes and meet our standards it is necessary to make the payment.
Publication fee (covers: publishing, review and databases indexing costs): 500 euros.
https://www.temjournal.com/oa/oa.html

Best Regards,

Editorial Board office,
office@temjournal.com
temjournal@gmail.com
www.temjournal.com

On Sat, Mar 5, 2022 at 3:05 AM <sulisworo@gmail.com> wrote:
Form details below.

First Name: Dwi

Last Name: Sulisworo
Email: sulisworo@gmail.com
Comments: Dear Editor,

This article is a development paper related to the use of loT in Education, especially for climate change lessons.
The title is Designing loT-based Smart Weather System to Promote Critical Thinking Skills.

Thank you very much for considering this article.

Best regards,

Prof. Dr. Dwi Sulisworo

sulisworo dwi <sulisworo@gmail.com> Wed, Mar 9, 2022 at 10:22 PM
To: TEM Journal <temjournal@gmail.com>

Dear Editor,

Thank you for your information.
[Quoted text hidden]

TEM Journal <temjournal@gmail.com> Fri, May 6, 2022 at 10:09 PM
To: sulisworo dwi <sulisworo@gmail.com>

Dear Dwi Sulisworo,

The paper originality is good.
We are sending you originality report of the text.

Insert an abstract of 70-160 words (not 238), giving a brief account of the most relevant aspects of the
paper.

When there are several consecutive citations then write: [1], [2], Not ( [1]-[2], [1-2], [1, 2] ), (not more
than two or three).
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After the corrections you should send us your paper again as soon as possible.

Best Regards,

Editorial Board office,
office@temjournal.com
temjournal@gmail.com
www.temjournal.com
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sulisworo dwi <sulisworo@gmail.com> Mon, May 9, 2022 at 12:14 PM
To: TEM Journal <temjournal@gmail.com>

Dear Editor,

Thank you very much for your valuable review.

Herewith the revised article according to your comments.
| am waiting for your feedback.

Best regards

Dwi Sulisworo

[Quoted text hidden]

@ Dwi Revision- TEM Journal.docx
411K

TEM Journal <temjournal@gmail.com> Tue, May 10, 2022 at 2:26 AM
To: sulisworo dwi <sulisworo@gmail.com>

Dear Dwi Sulisworo,

The paper has been accepted by the reviewers.
At the moment it is undergoing a language verification.
Soon we will inform you about the complete review.

Best Regards,

Editorial Board office,
office@temjournal.com
temjournal@gmail.com
www.temjournal.com

[Quoted text hidden]

sulisworo dwi <sulisworo@gmail.com> Tue, May 10, 2022 at 8:44 AM
To: TEM Journal <temjournal@gmail.com>

Thank you for the information.
[Quoted text hidden]

TEM Journal <temjournal@gmail.com> Tue, May 10, 2022 at 10:11 PM
To: sulisworo dwi <sulisworo@gmail.com>

Dear Dwi Sulisworo,

We have corrected several language errors and we are sending them for you to see what we have done
(COMMENTS). You do not need to send a correction unless you have a comment on the language
alterations we did.
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Your paper “Designing loT-based Smart Weather System to Promote Critical Thinking Skills* has been
accepted to be published and printed in the TEM Journal Vol.11, No.2, (in the last week of May, 2022).
Please sign the copyright agreement form, and send a scanned copy back to us.

Publication fee - APC (covers: publishing, review and databases indexing costs): 500 euros.

Closer guidelines for the payment:

e If you are paying personally (if APC is not covered by your institution or fund), you can choose
to pay by bank transfer into our official bank account, in any bigger bank (You have swift code and
all necessary information in the attached document). OR you can pay online (PayPal or Debit,
Credit Card) following this link:

https://www.temjournal.com/apc/apc.html

e If your institution pays for you, it is necessary to pay into our official bank account through Bank
Transfer.
You have swift code and all necessary information in the attached document:

Swift code is: DBDBRSBG

Our bank is: BANCA INTESA AD, BEOGRAD
Name of our company: UIKTEN

Address: Hilma Rozajca 15, Novi Pazar

Our account is: RS35160005400000087979
Country: Republic of Serbia

When you make the payment, you need to choose OUR (you need to cover all transfer charges).
After the payment you will receive Invoice, or you can request one before payment, if your institution or
bank needs one. In that case please write all necessary information (full name of institution, full address,
VAT number, number of grants- if any, etc..).

It is necessary to make the payment within 6 days.
After payment, please inform us.

Reminder:
Your paper must not be published elsewhere (journal, conference, etc.), in substantially the same
form, in English or in any other language.

You can find Camera-ready paper in the attachment.
Confirm that everything is OK.

Best Regards,

Editorial Board office,
office@temjournal.com
temjournal@gmail.com
www.temjournal.com

[Quoted text hidden]
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sulisworo dwi <sulisworo@gmail.com> Tue, May 10, 2022 at 11:08 PM
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To: TEM Journal <temjournal@gmail.com>

Dear publisher,

| am just paying the APC via Paypal as attached.
Please confirm receipt.

Thank you very much.

Best regards.

Dwi

[Quoted text hidden]

.D Gmail - Receipt for Your Payment to UIKTEN.PDF
119K

sulisworo dwi <sulisworo@gmail.com> Wed, May 11, 2022 at 6:52 PM
To: TEM Journal <temjournal@gmail.com>

Dear Editorial Team

Please find the signed copyright agreement attached to this email.
Thank you very much.

Best regards.

Dwi Sulisworo

[Quoted text hidden]

ﬂ Copyright Agreement Form_220511_164604.pdf
70K

TEM Journal <temjournal@gmail.com> Wed, May 11, 2022 at 8:39 PM
To: sulisworo dwi <sulisworo@gmail.com>

Dear Dwi Sulisworo,

We have received your payment and copyright agreement form.

We will inform you after publishing your paper (in the last week of May, 2022).

Best Regards,

Editorial Board office,
office@temjournal.com
temjournal@gmail.com
www.temjournal.com

[Quoted text hidden]


https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=68b5f19924&view=att&th=180ae4ca9224d8c7&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=180ae4c8f3fc5ee5cbc1&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=68b5f19924&view=att&th=180ae4ca9224d8c7&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=180ae4c8f3fc5ee5cbc1&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=68b5f19924&view=att&th=180b288644dbcd22&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=180b2885195bda4293d1&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=68b5f19924&view=att&th=180b288644dbcd22&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=180b2885195bda4293d1&safe=1&zw
mailto:office@temjournal.com
mailto:temjournal@gmail.com
http://www.temjournal.com/
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Re: Poslato sa sajta
2 messages

TEM Journal <temjournal@gmail.com> Tue, Aug 4, 2020 at 2:47 PM
To: sulisworo@gmail.com

Dear Dwi Sulisworo,

We have received your manuscript and forwarded it to reviewers.
Thank you for sending.

Best Regards,

Editorial Board office,
office@temjournal.com
temjournal@gmail.com
www.temjournal.com

On Sat, Aug 1, 2020 at 8:15 AM <sulisworo@gmail.com> wrote:
Form details below.

First Name: Dwi

Last Name: Sulisworo

Email: sulisworo@gmail.com

Comments: Dear Editor,

Herewith | submit my article. Please find it for the reviewing possibility. Thank you in advance.
Best regards.

Prof. Dr. Dwi Sulisworo

TEM Journal <temjournal@gmail.com> Tue, Sep 8, 2020 at 10:09 PM
To: sulisworo@gmail.com

Dear Dwi Sulisworo,,

Unfortunately your paper is not accepted by our reviewers.

The originality of the text is not acceptable (it shouldn't be less than 95%).

We are sending you originality report of the text.

The paper should be revised to a greater extent due to various omissions in order to achieve the necessary
quality for publication.

We cannot accept the corrected paper again for a review.

We may recommend that you submit the paper for publication in the SAR Journal.
If you wish we may consider your paper for publication in our scientific journal,
SAR journal.

Review criteria are milder in comparison to the TEM Journal.

Review process will be finished as soon as possible.

Next issue will be published in last week of September, 2020.

The publishing costs of a paper in this journal are 150 euros.

You can send it to: office.sarjournal@gmail.com or office@sarjournal.com
Web Address: www.sarjournal.com

Best Regards,

Editorial Board office,
office@temjournal.com
temjournal@gmail.com
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